
 
The Rotary Club of Pasadena Seeks Community 

Nominations for the 2024 Paul Harris Fellow Award 

 
PASADENA, CA – April 14, 2024 – The Rotary Club of Pasadena announces open nominations for this 
year’s Paul Harris Fellow Award. Community members are encouraged to nominate individuals who are 
involved with humanitarian service programs and who demonstrate active participation to help others.  
 
The Paul Harris Fellowship Award is one of the highest honors that Rotary can give to an individual. It 
recognizes a recipient who exemplifies the highest ideals of the Rotary. The award also includes a 
donation of $1,000 in the recipient’s name to The Rotary Foundation of Rotary International, which 
supports Rotary’s worldwide programs. The award will be given to a member of the Pasadena 
community who is not currently a Rotarian. The Rotary Club of Pasadena will announce the recipient’s 
name at an award ceremony luncheon on June 12, 2024.  
 
Nominees should exemplify the qualities and ideals of Rotary and have contributed to their community 
and world in a way that demonstrates that they share our motto “Service Above Self,” be active in 
community affairs, and be known in the business community as one who follows the “Four-Way Test.” 
 
Download the nomination form here. The deadline for nominations is May 3, 2024. For more 
information about the selection and nominee criteria, visit here. 

ROTARY, established in 1905, is an organization of business and professional leaders united worldwide 
to provide humanitarian service and help to build goodwill and peace in the world. It is comprised of 1.4 
million members working in more than 46,000 clubs in 220 countries and geographic regions providing 
over 16 million volunteer hours each year.  For more than 30 years, Rotary has been the driving force in 
the effort to end polio worldwide. 

ROTARY CLUB OF PASADENA has over 190 members that meet weekly with amazing, dedicated 
members contributing to the well-being and growth of the community, region, and world. Committees 
Include: Dan Stove Music Contest; Four-Way Test Speech Contest; Community Grants; International 
Projects; Done In A Day Project; Toy Drive; RYLA -Teen Leadership; Shop with a Cop; and Teachers of 
Excellence, Fight to Erase Polio, as well as fun social events. The Rotary Club of Pasadena is the oldest 
and largest Rotary Club in Rotary District 5300 under the leadership of District Governor Michael Soden. 
www.pasadenarotary.com  

MEDIA CONTACT 
Catherine Haskett Hany 
(626) 818-9157 
chhany@pacbell.net 

https://www.dacdb.com/Rotary/Accounts/5300/Downloads/794/Community%20Paul%20Harris%20Fellow%20Award%20Nomination%20Form%20-%202024.pdf
https://www.pasadenarotary.com/?page_id=6860&preview=true
mailto:chhany@pacbell.net

